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Erosion
Highly eroded tributaries have
begun to erode adjacent trails

Erosion
Storm drain run-offs have created
deep and wide gullies from the 
residential land uses on the mesa 
to the bottom of the canyon and 
could potentially affect trails

Lack of amenities
Lack of parking and restrooms 
for users accessing Rose Canyon 
Open Space from Genesee Ave
and Regents Road.

Lack of appropriate railroad 
crossings force users to unsafely
cross the railroad tracks

Closed railroad crossing

Non-existing trail connection
between Marian Bear Memorial 
Park and Rose Canyon Open 
Space

Disconnected trail system

Unsafe creek crossing

Users must cross Rose Creek
without a bridge or safe path 
to access the Marian Bear 
Memorial Park trail system.

Creek crossing
Numerous stream intersections
without means to cross them
safely

Users must cross Genesee
Avenue to connect the trail system 
of  Marian Bear Memorial Park

Disconnected trail system


